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Walter E. Kaegi

Walter E. Kaegi returned to the U.S. on September 10, 2005, from a twelve-month leave of ab-
sence on a Fulbright-Hays fellowship that took him to Tunisia, Algeria, and Morocco. During the 
Fellowship he investigated “The Dynamics of the Muslim Conquest and Byzantine Collapse in 
North Africa.” He now has written more than 410 pages of a book manuscript by that title, which 
he is now polishing for submission to a publisher. His Fellowship activities were reported in the 
spring 2006 issue of Tableau, the newsletter of the Division of the Humanities. He also worked 
with the American Council for Learned Societies in the preparation of three older publications 
of his (Byzantium and the Decline of Rome [1968], Byzantine Military Unrest 471–843 [1981], 
Some Thoughts on Byzantine Military Strategy [1983]) for re-edition as electronic books, which 
will occur in 2007.

He corrected proofs for Chapter 9 of Cambridge History of the Byzantine Empire, edited by 
Jonathan Shepard: “Confronting Islam: Changing Intensities of Military and Political Relation-
ships Between Byzantium and Islam, 641–1000 CE.” It is now in press. 

He published “The Early Muslim Raids into Anatolia and Byzantine Reactions under Emperor 
Constans II,” in The Encounter of Eastern Christianity with Early Islam, edited by Emmanouela 
Grypeou, Mark N. Swanson, David Thomas, pp. 73–93. Leiden: Brill, 2006. 

He completed an article for publication, which was accepted: “The Battle of Sbeitla and the 
Aures.” To be published on pp. 185–206 in volume 3 of the journal AOURAS (Organ of the 
Société d’études et de recherches sur de l’Aurès antique). He also finished a book review of 
Cambridge Companion to the Age of Justinian, by Michael Maas, for the Journal of Near Eastern 
Studies.

Kaegi delivered five public lectures: “Fighting, Combat,” Summer School, University of 
Bologna, Sede Ravenna, Italy (September 22, 2005); “The Dynamics of Muslim Expansion 
and Byzantine Collapse in North Africa,” Late Antique and Byzantine Workshop, University of 
Chicago (October 4, 2005); “Byzantine Numidia: Another Look,” Byzantine Studies Confer-
ence, University of Georgia, Athens (October 30, 2005); “Byzantine History” session on panel 
at Alternate History Conference, Rosemont, Illinois (November 13, 2005); and “Reflections on 
Some Military Conditions and Practices in Byzantine North Africa,” Late Antiquity in Illinois II: 
A Symposium at the University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign (March 18, 2006).

On January 26, 2006, he gave an extended interview to William McKeen, Chair, School of 
Journalism, University of Florida, for a biography of the recently deceased author and journalist 
Hunter S. Thompson (a boyhood friend, who wrote contributions in their childhood newspaper 
The Southern Star between 1947 and 1950).

Kaegi had many responsibilities on his return from leave. In addition to serving on various 
committees and preparing and chairing several examinations and one dissertation defense, he was 
Co-Director with Michael Allen (Classics) of the Workshop on Late Antiquity and Byzantium, 
which had a very active schedule.

——————————

Carol Meyer

After eleven-and-a-half years in the software industry, Carol Meyer resigned from Aquitec at the 
end of November 2005 in order to concentrate on archaeological projects. She completed a re-
view of La Route de Myos Hormos for the Journal of Near Eastern Studies and a short article on 
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“Documentation and Conservation of Bir Umm Fawakhir” for the Egyptian Antiquities Project’s 
Preserving Egypt’s Cultural Heritage. Most of Meyer’s efforts since January have gone into 
completing the manuscript of the Bir Umm Fawakhir 1996 and 1997 survey seasons. Four core 
chapters on pre-Coptic finds, the detailed survey of the Main Settlement, the less-detailed surveys 
of ten of the fourteen outliers, and small finds and dipinti are written and illustrations prepared, 
barring only final corrections to the main map, incorporating Lisa Heidorn’s notes on pre-Coptic 
pottery, and numbering the figures. The chapter on the cemeteries is in progress, and the one on 
ancient mining and ore reduction will be a less technical version of the long article that appeared 
in the Journal of the American Research Center in Egypt. This leaves a long chapter on Coptic/
Byzantine pottery and the Introduction and Conclusions. The goal is to submit the manuscript to 
the editorial office in October. Finally, Meyer is organizing a session on “Medieval Islamic Port 
Towns” for the International Medieval Congress that will meet in Leeds, England, in July 2007.

——————————

Seth Richardson

Seth Richardson spent the year completing manuscripts for three articles, including “The World 
of the Babylonian Countryside,” for a forthcoming Routledge edition of collected essays entitled 
The Babylonian World (Gwendolyn Leick ed.); “Death and Dismemberment in Mesopotamia: 
Discorporation between the Body and Body Politic,” for the upcoming Oriental Institute Seminars 
volume following the two-day seminar “Performing Death” (ed. Nicola Laneri); and the article 
“gir3-gen-na and Shulgi’s ‘Library’: Liver Omen Texts in the Third Millennium b.c. (I),” on the 
online Cuneiform Digital Library Journal 2006: 3 (http://cdli.ucla.edu/pubs/cdlj/2006/cdlj2006_
003.html). During this time, three book reviews also appeared in print. In a busy spring, Rich-
ardson delivered three papers, including the “Death and Dismemberment” talk in February. In 
March, he delivered a paper at the Seattle meeting of the American Oriental Society on rebellion 
in ancient Mesopotamia as part of a panel of eight speakers he organized to examine the subject 
of revolts and political peripheries in the ancient cuneiform-writing world. (A volume publishing 
these papers is in the planning stages.) In May, he traveled to Bellingham, Washington, to partici-
pate in a three-day invited conference on The Organization of Knowledge in Antiquity, speaking 
on archives at Old Babylonian Sippar.

Among the committee work, advising, and teaching, Richardson is especially pleased this 
year to acknowledge the members of the College seminar he taught on “Babylonian Knowledge,” 
which introduced readers to major forms of knowledge represented in the Mesopotamian canon 
— liver omens, astronomical texts, and magical practice. Great material and wonderful students! 
Although he looks forward to co-teaching (with Oriental Institute Museum Director Geoff Em-
berling) part of a new College Core sequence on the Neo-Assyrian Empire in the fall, he also 
anticipates a quiet and productive year of research in his residential fellowship at the University’s 
Franke Institute for the Humanities. He will continue the preparation of editions of Late Old Bab-
ylonian legal and administrative tablets in connection with a series of articles on subjects related 
to the political history of seventeenth-century b.c. Babylonia, and the collapse of the state most 
famous for the achievements of its King Hammurabi the century before.

——————————
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